
$1,200,000 - 5730 N Highway 183, Liberty Hill
MLS® #1935399 

$1,200,000
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 2,080 sqft
Residential on 10.00 Acres

Twin Lakes Estates, Liberty Hill, TX

Quaint home on 10 acres with two primary
bedrooms! Detached 3 car garage and 40x45
ft insulated, solar powered metal building/RV
storage onsite with 14' roll up door! 2 ovens
and upgraded appliances.  No HOA! No
carpet! New security gate at entrance to
property August 2021, septic has been
maintained and the well pump and all electrical
(control panel, etc) for the well have recently
been replaced/upgraded. Additional
outbuilding/barn for storage or animals. 
Chickens convey! Watch the deer play in the
yard while relaxing on the porch under the
shade. With this fantastic location you have
easy access to town.  Up to 2 houses allowed
on the 10 acres. Could be a great opportunity
to work and live on the same property as there
is plenty of space for trucks/material storage!

Built in 1986

Essential Information

ListingFeed abor_vow

MLS® # 1935399

List Price $1,200,000

Sale Price $1,080,000

Sale Date November 30th, 2021

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 2,080



Acres 10.00

Year Built 1986

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Community Information

Address 5730 N Highway 183

Subdivision Twin Lakes Estates

City Liberty Hill

County Williamson

State TX

Zip Code 78642

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Available

Features None

Parking Detached, Garage, RV Garage

# of Garages 3

View Park/Greenbelt, Trees/Woods

Waterfront None

Interior

Interior Linoleum, Tile, Wood

Appliances Built-In Electric Oven, Dishwasher, Electric Oven, Electric Range,
Electric Water Heater, Disposal, Microwave

Heating Central

Cooling Central Air

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Family Room, Wood Burning

# of Stories 1

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Features Exterior Steps, Private Yard

Lot Description Level, Many Trees, Trees Large Size, Trees Medium Size, Xeriscape

Windows Blinds

Roof Metal



Construction Masonry

Foundation Pillar/Post/Pier

School Information

District Liberty Hill ISD

Elementary Liberty Hill

Middle Liberty Hill Intermediate

High Liberty Hill


