
$950 - 714 Sutton Drive, Killeen
MLS® #3641082 

$950
2 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 1,671 sqft
Rental on 0.20 Acres

Killeen Heights North Unit 1st, Killeen, TX

Introducing this cozy duplex nestled at 714
Sutton Dr in Killeen. Positioned in a
sought-after area, this home brings together
convenience and comfort seamlessly.

Step inside to explore a thoughtfully designed
living space, perfect for contemporary living.
Offering 2 bedrooms and 1 full bathroom, this
residence ensures comfortable
accommodations for its occupants.

Conveniently located just a short walk from
Conder Community Park, outdoor lovers will
appreciate the nearby green spaces for
leisurely strolls or outdoor activities. And with
Killeen Mall and HEB Plus just a quick
5-minute drive away, residents enjoy easy
access to a variety of shopping, dining, and
entertainment options.

Adding to its appeal, this duplex comes
complete with its own private yard, ideal for
relaxing outdoors or indulging in a spot of
gardening. Additionally, the attached garage
provides hassle-free parking and extra storage
space.

Situated in a desirable neighborhood, 714
Sutton Dr offers the perfect blend of suburban
tranquility and urban conveniences. Don't miss
out on the chance to make this charming
property your next home. Schedule a showing
today!



Built in 1958

Essential Information

ListingFeed abor_vow

MLS® # 3641082

List Price $950

Sale Price $975

Sale Date May 10th, 2024

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 1,671

Acres 0.20

Year Built 1958

Type Rental

Sub-Type Duplex

Status Closed

Community Information

Address 714 Sutton Drive

Subdivision Killeen Heights North Unit 1st

City Killeen

County Bell

State TX

Zip Code 76541

Amenities

Utilities Cable Available, Electricity Available, Sewer Available, Water Available,
Sewer Not Available

Features Park, Shopping

Parking Driveway, Garage

# of Garages 1

Interior

Interior Tile

Appliances Dryer, Microwave, Oven, Refrigerator, Washer

Cooling Central Air, Ceiling Fan(s)

# of Stories 1

Stories One



Exterior

Exterior Features Private Entrance, Private Yard

Lot Description Back Yard, Front Yard

Windows Blinds

School Information

District Killeen ISD

Elementary Clifton Park

Middle Manor (Killeen ISD)

High Killeen


