
$1,200,000 - 17907 Crystal Cove, Jonestown
MLS® #3850694 

$1,200,000
5 Bedroom, 5.00 Bathroom, 3,996 sqft
Residential on 1.00 Acres

Northlake Hills Sec 01, Jonestown, TX

Click the Virtual Tour link to view the 3D
walkthrough. Secluded yet not secluded! Your
dream home awaits! Stunning residence
surrounded by hill country beauty and lake
views with amazing tree coverage. Gourmet
kitchen with gas cooktop, double opens, huge
center island and breakfast bar. A chef and
entertainer's delight with wood burning pizza
oven and beverage/wine cooler! Multiple living
and dining areas. Fresh paint and plenty of
room to entertain. Spacious primary bedroom
on main level with great distance from living
area with luxurious bath en suite. Upper
bedrooms are peaceful retreats with window
nooks. Large media/craft/office room. Amazing
storage areas. Sprawling private backyard and
patio space to enjoy. Close proximity to marina
and Lago Vista schools You don't want to miss
this opportunity!

Built in 2005

Essential Information

ListingFeed abor_vow

MLS® # 3850694

List Price $1,200,000

Sale Price $1,000,000

Sale Date September 23rd, 2021

Bedrooms 5

Bathrooms 5.00

Full Baths 3



Half Baths 2

Square Footage 3,996

Acres 1.00

Year Built 2005

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Community Information

Address 17907 Crystal Cove

Subdivision Northlake Hills Sec 01

City Jonestown

County Travis

State TX

Zip Code 78645

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Available, Propane, Water Available

Features Lake, Park, Trails/Paths

Parking Attached, Driveway, Garage

# of Garages 3

View Hills, Lake, Neighborhood

Waterfront None

Interior

Interior Concrete, Vinyl

Appliances Double Oven, Dishwasher, Gas Cooktop, Microwave, See Remarks

Heating Central

Cooling Central Air, Ceiling Fan(s)

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Family Room

# of Stories 2

Stories Two

Exterior

Exterior Features Private Yard

Lot Description Back Yard, Cul-De-Sac, Front Yard, Many Trees

Windows Window Coverings



Roof Composition

Construction Masonry, Stone Veneer, Stucco

Foundation Slab

School Information

District Lago Vista ISD

Elementary Lago Vista

Middle Lago Vista

High Lago Vista


