
$1,225 - 8704 Schick Road D, Austin
MLS® #3963582 

$1,225
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 900 sqft
Rental on 0.23 Acres

Turtle Rock Estates, Austin, TX

Welcome to our affordable two bedroom
duplex located in the vibrant city of Austin, TX.
This charming home features 2 bedrooms and
1.5 bathrooms, providing ample space for
comfortable living. The unit boasts modern
amenities such as central AC, ensuring a cool
and comfortable environment year-round. The
stained concrete floors add a touch of
elegance and are easy to maintain. For your
convenience, washer dryer hookups are
available. Additionally, the home includes a
one car garage, providing secure parking and
extra storage space. You'll have access to a
variety of dining, shopping, and entertainment
options, ensuring you'll never have a dull
moment. Don't miss out on this fantastic
opportunity to call this affordable two bedroom
your new home. Contact us today to schedule
a viewing!

Built in 1988

Essential Information

ListingFeed abor_vow

MLS® # 3963582

List Price $1,225

Sale Price $1,225

Sale Date December 19th, 2023

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 1



Half Baths 1

Square Footage 900

Acres 0.23

Year Built 1988

Type Rental

Sub-Type Quadruplex

Status Closed

Community Information

Address 8704 Schick Road D

Subdivision Turtle Rock Estates

City Austin

County Williamson

State TX

Zip Code 78729

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Available

Features Community Mailbox

Parking Garage

# of Garages 1

View None

Waterfront None

Interior

Interior Concrete, Laminate

Appliances Dishwasher, Free-Standing Range, Refrigerator

Heating Central, Electric

Cooling Central Air

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces None

# of Stories 2

Stories Two

Exterior

Lot Description None

Windows None

Roof Composition



Construction Brick Veneer, Frame

Foundation Slab

School Information

District Round Rock ISD

Elementary Live Oak

Middle Deerpark

High McNeil


