
$1,100,000 - 4971 Fm 2843, Salado
MLS® #6993866 

$1,100,000
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 4,569 sqft
Residential on 6.09 Acres

Sunwest Estates, Salado, TX

This stunning 4 bedroom 2 and a half bath
home located just west of Salado is fully
fenced and gated with private access control.
When you walk into the great room with
soaring ceilings, large windows, a gorgeous
stone fireplace and an amazing open kitchen,
you will know that you are home!  The granite
countertops go around the kitchen and
continue onto the 2 large islands with plenty of
storage. The kitchen boasts two ovens, a food
warmer and a large walk-in pantry.  On one
side of the home is a spacious primary
bedroom which features a spa-like bathroom
with marble countertops, 2 walk-in closets,
exercise room and a separate tub and shower.
 There are 3 bedrooms on the opposite side of
the home, a full bath and a half bath.  Walk
into the dedicated office space that has built in
shelves, granite countertops and a wall of
windows that look out over the expansive back
yard.  This home is a must see!

Built in 2002

Essential Information

ListingFeed abor_vow

MLS® # 6993866

List Price $1,100,000

Sale Price $998,000

Sale Date November 4th, 2021

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00



Full Baths 2

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 4,569

Acres 6.09

Year Built 2002

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Community Information

Address 4971 Fm 2843

Subdivision Sunwest Estates

City Salado

County Bell

State TX

Zip Code 76571

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Available

Features None

Parking Driveway, Garage, Oversized, Storage

# of Garages 3

Garages Garage Door Opener

View Pasture, Trees/Woods

Waterfront None

Interior

Interior Carpet, Tile

Appliances Cooktop, Dishwasher, Electric Cooktop, Microwave, Oven, Water
Softener Owned

Heating Electric

Cooling Electric

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Family Room, Living Room, Stone, Wood Burning

# of Stories 1

Stories One

Exterior



Lot Description Many Trees

Windows Blinds

Roof Metal

Construction Masonry, Stone

Foundation Slab

School Information

District Salado ISD

Elementary Thomas Arnold

Middle Salado

High Salado


