
$1,275 - 1007 Water Street 105, Bastrop
MLS® #7348090 

$1,275
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,005 sqft
Rental on 0.06 Acres

Building Blk, Bastrop, TX

An excellent opportunity to live in a cute,
spacious unit in the highly desirable downtown
area of Bastrop - Close to the food court,
Downtown, the library and many fun venues!
Also close to Fisherman's Park.  Roomy
downstairs living room with a cozy fireplace, a
laundry closet, 1/2 bath and storage under the
stairs.  Both bedrooms are upstairs with a
shared Full Bath, a balcony off of one of the
Bedrooms.
  Deposits will be collected once application is
approved in certified funds. Full monthâ€™s
rent due at move in - prorated due second
month, if applicable.  NO PETS Service
animals are not a pet. Please be sure to
complete the Request for an Assistance
Animal document attached to the listing and
select the correct option when completing the
pet screening.  ALL APPLICANTS whether
they have an animal or not must register at
https://reinemundrealestate.petscreening.com/

Built in 1982

Essential Information

ListingFeed abor_vow

MLS® # 7348090

List Price $1,275

Sale Price $1,275

Sale Date December 1st, 2023

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00



Full Baths 1

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 1,005

Acres 0.06

Year Built 1982

Type Rental

Sub-Type Apartment

Status Closed

Community Information

Address 1007 Water Street 105

Subdivision Building Blk

City Bastrop

County Bastrop

State TX

Zip Code 78602

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Connected, Sewer Connected, Water Connected

Features None

Parking Off Street, Outside

View City

Waterfront None

Interior

Interior Carpet, Tile

Appliances Dishwasher, Electric Water Heater, Free-Standing Electric Range,
Refrigerator, Range Hood

Heating Central

Cooling Central Air

# of Stories 2

Stories Two

Exterior

Lot Description City Lot

Windows Blinds

Roof Shingle

Construction HardiPlank Type

Foundation Slab



School Information

District Bastrop ISD

Elementary Mina

Middle Bastrop Intermediate

High Bastrop


